COUNCIL PRESIDENT-JOHN S. DIETRICH COUNCIL WARD ONE-BRIAN DEMBINSKI

COUNCIL AT LARGE-DAVID JANIK COUNCIL WARD TWO- DAVE GOODELL
COUNCIL AT LARGEJOSEPH MILLER COUNCIL WARD THREE-CHUCK WINIARSKI
COUNCIL AT LARGE- PHIL VAN TREUREN - COUNCIL WARD FOUR-JENNIFER WASILK

£ LI

i F
&

CITY OF AMHERST, OHIO

OFFICE OF THE . LINDA TURLEY
CLERK OF COUNCIL 206 SOUTH MAIN STREET
(440) 988-2420 AMHERST, OH 44001
(440) 988-2570 fax council@amherstohio.org
AGENDA

JUNE 12, 2017 0-17-25
REGULAR MEETING R-17-04
7:00 P. M. A-17-33
1 Roll call:  Mr. Janik, Mr. Goodell, Mr. Van Treuren, Mrs. Wasilk, Mr. Winiarski, Mr. Dembinski, Mr. Miller

2 Prayer: Chaplin Wasilk

3 Pledge to the Flag: Sergeant at Arms Dembinski
4 Letter of resignation of Council Clerk Linda Turley
5 Appointment of new Clerk of Council

6 Consent Agenda: Minutes of the Regular Council Meeting held May 22, 2017
Minutes of the Streets Committee Meeting held June 5, 2017
Minutes of the Building and Lands Committee Meeting held June 5, 2017

7. Acknowledgement of the public pertaining to items on the agenda

8. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS FIRST READING:

(a) An ordinance amending Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 903. (a-17-29)

(b) An ordinance amending Amherst Codified Ordinance part thirteen-Building Code, Title One-Standards,
establishing new standards by adopting a new chapter 1301 and by amendments to Chapters 1303, 1305,

1307, 1309, 1311, 1313, and 1315. (a-17-30)

(c) An ordinance amending Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 919. (a-17-31)
(d) An ordinance amending Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapters 1331, 1336 and 1337. (a-17-32)

9. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS SECOND READING:

10. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS THIRD READING:
(a) An ordinance authorizing the increase in appropriations for refunds and reimbursements Account 610-
5003-52730. (a-17-22)

11. Miscellaneous and acknowledgement of the public

12. Agenda requests and committee meeting schedules

13.  Reports of the Administration

14.  Acknowledgement of reports of the Auditor and Treasurer

15.  Adjournment



A-17-29
ORDINANCE NO. 0-17-
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AMHERST CODIFIED ORDINANCE CHAPTER 903.

WHEREAS, the Streets Committee of the Council of the City of Amherst, Ohio, at a meeting
held on June 5, 2017 met to consider the matter of the amendment of Part Nine — Streets and
Public Services Code, Title One — Street and Sidewalk Areas, by amendments to Chapter 903 -
Sidewalks; and

WHEREAS, the Streets Committee voted to take the matter to the floor of Council: and

WHEREAS. the Council of the City of Amherst deems it desirable for the public welfare and
safety of persons within the City to amend Amherst Coditied Ordinance Part Nine - Streets and
Public Services Code. Title One — Streets and Sidewalk Areas, by amendments to Chapter 903
- Sidewalks.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Amherst, County of
Lorain, State of Ohio:

SECTION 1: That the index and cross references following the index to Chapter 903 of the
Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst be amended to provide as follows:

CHAPTER 903
Sidewalks

903.01 Authority.

903.02 Responsibility of Owners.

903.03 General Construction Requirements.

903.04 Reconstruction and Repair Procedure,
903.05 Emergency Repairs.

903.06 Permit for Sidewalk Construction or Repair.
903.99 Penalty.

CROSS REFERENCES |
Construction or repair at owner's expense - see Ohio R.C. 729.01 et seq. .
Notice to construct or repair sidewalks - see Ohio R.C. 729.03 et seq.
Assessment of costs of improvements — see Ohio R.C. 729.04 et seq.
Duty to keep sidewalks in repair and clean - see H. S. & S 521.06
Barricades and warning lights; abandoned excavations - see H. S. & S 521.03
Sidewalks in new subdivisions - see P. & Z. 1113.04
Streets and Sidewalks Repair Advisory Committee - see ADM. 121.10

SECTION 2: That former section 903.01 entitled “Authority” of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances is amended to provide in its entirety as follows:

903.01 AUTHORITY.

For the construction or repair of sidewalks within the City right-of-way the
procedures and assessments shall be in accordance with Ohio R.C. 729.01 through
729.10. and Ohio R.C. 735.02, 735.05 and 735.32 and other applicable State statutes
and/or resolutions or ordinances of the City pertinent to the subject matter herein.

(Ord. XX-XX. Passed XX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 3: That former section 903.07 entitled "Responsibility of Owners" of the Amherst
Codified Ordinances is renumbered to 903.02 and is amended to provide in its entirety as
follows:

903.02 RESPONSIBILITY OF OWNERS,

(a) All owners of property within the City, whose property abuts upon
sidewalks on City streets, shall keep such sidewalks in good repair and free from
defects, snow, ice, water and other obstructions or dangerous conditions. The ground |



between sidewalk and street curb or gutter shall be hept graded so that water will drain

from sidewalks [If such sidewalks become defective. dangerous or obstructed in any

way, the Safety Service Director may proceed to remove such defects, dangerous
conditions or obstructions and grade the areas between sidewalks and curbs so that

water will drain trom such walks.

(b Any new building coustructed on any parcel that is not subject (o

Chapter 1109 of the Planning and Zoning Code shall construct a concrete sidewalk in
the public right-of-way and parallel Lo the street trontage unless otherwise approved

Corner

lots shall include the installation of sidewalks on both frontages to include

handicap accessible crossing tamps as required  The Building Ofticial shall not issue a

final certificate ot occupancy for the newly constructed building without the sidewalk

being installed
(Ord. XX-XX. Passed XX-XX-XX))

SECTION 4:

[hat tormer section 903.02 entitled "General Construction Requirements” is

renumbered to section 903.03 and is amended to provide in its entirety as tollows:

903.03 GENERAL CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS.

All sidewalks constructed or repaired on City streets or alleys or on public

property shall be in accordance with design standards, plans and specifications prepared

by the City Engineer and building code standards as provided in part thirteen, title one

of the Amherst Coditied Ordinances, under the direction and inspection and to the

satisfaction of the Building Official or his authorized agent.
(Ord. XX-XX. Passed XX-XX-XX)

SECTION 5:

That section 903.04 entitled "Reconstruction and Repair Procedure” is hereby

amended to provide in its entirety as follows:

903.04 RECONSTRUCTION AND REPAIR PROCEDURE.

The City incorporates as part of the Amherst Coditied Ordinances, as if fully

rewritten herein, sections 729.01 through 729 10 of the Ohio Revised Code as it

pertains to City assessments for the construction or repair of sidewalks within the City
(Ord. XX-XX Passed XX-XX-XX)

SECTION 6:

That former section 903.06 entitled "Emergency Repairs” is renumbered to

section 903.05 and is hereby amended to provide in its entirety as follows:

903.05 EMERGENCY REPAIRS.

Where no general resolution is passed by Council for any year, the Safety

Service Director, or their designee. may proceed as above for emergency repairs.
(Ord. XX-XX Passed XX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 7:

That former section 903.09 entitled "Permit for New Sidewalk Construction” is

renumbered to section 903.06 and is hereby amended to be entitled "Permit for Sidewalk

Construction or Repair" and is amended to provide in its entirety as follows:

903.06 PERMIT FOR SIDEWALK CONSTRUCTION OR REPAIR.

No person shall construct or repair sidewalks within the City right-of-way

without having obtained a permit therefor. The sidewalk construction permit shall be
obtained from the Building Department at no cost to the property owner. The purpose
of the permit is to insure the construction or repair is completed in accordance with City

design standards, plans, specitications and building code standards.
(Ord. XX-XX. Passed XX-XX-XX\)

SECTION 8:

That section 903.99 entitled "Penalty" is hereby amended to provide in its

entirety as follows:



903.99 PENALTY.

(a) Whoever violates any provision of this chapter, or any eftective rule or
regulation promulgated hereunder, or fails to comply therewith or with any written
notice or written order issued hereunder, or whoever refuses to permit lawful entry by
the City or their representatives, and whoever interferes with, obstructs or hinders such
attempt to make a lawful inspection or repair, shall be tined not more than three
hundred dollars ($300.00) for each offense. Each day any such violation of this chapter
is committed, continued or permitted shall constitute a separate offense.

(b The imposition of any penalty shall not preclude the Law Director from
instituting an appropriate action or proceeding in a court of proper jurisdiction to
prevent an unlawful repair or maintenance; or to correct or abate a violation. or to
prevent the compliance with the provisions of this chapter, or other applicable laws,
ordinances, rules or regulations, or the orders or determinations of the Building Official
or the Board.

(Ord. XX-XX. Passed XX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 9: That former sections 903.03 entitled "New Construction Procedure”. section
903.05 entitled "City to Share Overhead Costs" and section 903.08 entitled "Contractor to Mark
Concrete" are hereby repealed.

SECTION 10: That it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council
concerning and relating to the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of
this Council. and that all deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees that resulted
in such formal action, were in meetings open to the public, in compliance with all legal
requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code

SECTION 11: That this Ordinance shall take eftect at the earliest period allowed by law.

1¥ reading

2" reading John S. Dietrich, President ot Council
3" reading

PASSED APPROVED

ATTEST
Mark Costilow, Mayor

Approved as to form by

Anthony R. Pecora, Director of Law

Filed with the Mayor:

A-17-31



A-17-30
ORDINANCE NO. O-17-____

AN  ORDINANCE AMENDING AMHERST CODIFIED ORDINANCE PART
THIRTEEN - BUILDING CODE, TITLE ONE - STANDARDS, ESTABLISHING NEW
STANDARDS BY ADOPTING A NEW CHAPTER 1301 AND BY AMENDMENTS TO
CHAPTERS 1303, 1305, 1307, 1309, 1311, 1313 AND 1315,

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee of the Council ot the City of Amherst. Ohio.
at a meeting held on June 5. 2017 met to consider the matter of the amendment of Part Thirteen
- Building Code. Title One - Standards. by the adoption of a new Chapter 1301 and by
amendments to Chapters 1303, 1305, 1307. 1309. 1311. 1313 and 1315 so as to amend and
establish new standards for buildings and residential structures. amend and establish new
mechanical. plumbing and electrical codes. establish a new fuel gas code, a new energy
conservation code and a new code for accessibility for physically disabled persons: and

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee voted to take the matter to the floor of
Council: and

WHEREAS. the Council of the City of Amherst deems it desirable for the public welfare and
safety of persons within the City to amend Ambherst Codified Ordinance Part [hirteen -
Building Code, Title One - Standards. in the manner set forth in the following sections.

NOW. THEREFORE. BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Amherst. County ot
Lorain, State of Ohjo:

SECTION 1: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1301. previously repealed by
Ordinance 0-02-158 passed on December 9. 2001 is hereby adopted as a new Chapter 1301 to
provide in its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1301
Building Code

1301.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C, 731.231

1301.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Coditied
Ordinances, as il fully rewritten herein. that certain code known as the Ohio Building

Code (OBC), current Edition, as published in Chapter 4101:1-1 et seq.. ot the Ohio
Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor organization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereot
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord O-17- . Passed xx-xx-ax.)

SECTION 2: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1303 is bereby amended to provide in
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1303
Residential Building Code (for One-Two-, and Three Family Dwellings)

1303.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231



1303.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances. as if fully rewritten herein, that certain code known as the Residential Code
of Ohio (RCO), current Edition, as published in Chapter 4101:8-1 et seq., of the Ohio
Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor otganization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 3: That Amherst Coditied Ordinance Chapter 1305 is hereby amended to provide in
its entirety as tollows:

CHAPTER 1305
Mechanical Code

1305.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions - see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231
Power to license specialty contractors — see Ohio R.C. 715.27

1305.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein, that certain code known as the Ohio Mechanical
Code (OMC), current Edition, as published in Chapter 4101:2-1 et seq., of the Ohio
Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor organization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 4: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1307 is hereby amended to provide in
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1307
Plumbing Code

1307.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231
Power to license specialty contractors — see Ohio R.C. 715.27

1307.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein. that certain code known as the Ohio Plumbing
Code (OPC), current Edition, as published in Chapter 4101:3-1 et seq., of the Ohio
Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor organization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such contlict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 5: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1308 is hereby repealed.




SECTION 6: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1309 is hereby amended to provide in
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1309
Electrical Code

1309.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES

Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1

Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Oftenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231
Power to license specialty contractors — see Ohio R.C. 715.27
General rules and regulations — see S. & P. S. Ch. 919

1309.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein, that certain code known as the National
Electrical Code (NEC), promulgated and published by the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) known as NFPA 70, current Edition as published in Chapter
4101:1-27 et seq., of the Ohio Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of
Building Standards or any successor organization, as the same may from time to time
be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 7: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1311 is hereby amended to provide in
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1311
Fuel Gas Code

1311.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231
Power to license specialty contractors — see Ohio R.C. 715.27

1311.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein, that certain code known as the International
Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), promulgated and published by International Code Committee
(1CC). current Fidition as puldished in Chapter 4101:1-2% et seq.. of the Ohio
Administrative Linle and adipled by the Ohio Board of Huilding Standards or any
successor organization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict. |

(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.) |

SECTION 8: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1313 is hereby amended to provide in |
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1313
Energy Conservation Code

1313.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Referenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1



Building Standards — General Provisions - see Ohio R.C 3781
Building Standards — Ottenses and Penalties — see Ohio R C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731 231

1313.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein, that certain code known as the International
Energy Conservation Code (IECC), promulgated and published by International Code
Committee (ICC), current Edition as published in Chapter 4101:1-13 et seq., of the
Ohio Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor organization. as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 9: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1315 is hereby amended to provide in
its entirety as follows:

CHAPTER 1315
Accessibility for Physically Disabled Persons

1315.01  Adopted.

CROSS REFERENCES
Reterenced standards — see Ohio A.C. 4101:1-1
Building Standards — General Provisions — see Ohio R.C. 3781
Building Standards — Offenses and Penalties — see Ohio R.C. 3791
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R.C. 731.231

1315.01 ADOPTED.

(a) The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Codified
Ordinances, as if fully rewritten herein, that certain section contained within the Ohio
Building Code, current Edition, as published in Chapter 4101:1-11 et seq., of the Ohio
Administrative Code and adopted by the Ohio Board of Building Standards or any
successor organization, as the same may from time to time be amended or replaced.

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in conflict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 10: That the index for Part Thirteen - Building Code is hereby amended to set forth
the following:

TITLE ONE - Standards
Chap. 1301. Building Code
Chap. 1303 Residential Building Code (for One-, Two-, Three-Family
Dwellings)
Chap. 1305 Mechanical Code
Chap. 1307 Plumbing Code
Chap. 1309 Electrical Code
Chap. 1311 Fuel Gas Code
Chap. 1313 Energy Conservation Code
Chap. 1315 Accessibility for Physically Disabled Persons

SECTION 11: That it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council
concerning and relating to the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of
this Council, and that all deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees that resulted
in such formal action, were in meetings open to the public, in compliance with all legal
requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code

SECTION 12: That this Ordinance shall take effect at the earliest period allowed by law.



1" reading
d .
2™ reading
3" reading

PASSED

ATTEST
|| Approved as to form by:

Anthony R. Pecora, Director of Law

|| Filed with the Mayor:

A-17-30

John S. Dietrich, President of Council

APPROVED

Mark Costilow, Mayor




A-17-31
ORDINANCE NO. O-17-
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AMHERST CODIFIED ORDINANCE CHAPTER 919.

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee of the Council of the City of Amherst. Ohio.
at a meeting held on June 3. 2017 met to consider the matter of the amendment of Part Nine —
Streets and Public Services Code. Title Three ~ Public Utilitics, by amendments to Chapter 919
so as to amend the standards for providing electrical service to the public; and

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee voted to take the matter to the floor of
Council: and

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Amherst deems it desirable for the public welfare and
safety of persons within the City to amend Amherst Coditied Ordinance Part Nine — Streets and
Public Services Code. Title Three — Public Utilities, Chapter 919 in the manner set forth in the
following sections.

NOW. THEREFORE. BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Ambherst. County of
Lorain. State of Ohio:

SECTION 1: That the index and cross references following the index to Chapter 919 of the
Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst be amended to provide as follows:

CHAPTER 919
Electricity

EDITOR'S NOTE: The provisions of this chapter were derived from resolutions
enacted by the Village Board of Trustees of Public Affairs under the authority of Ohio
R.C. 735.29 which provides that the Board shall manage, conduct and control the
electric light plant. Upon achieving City status, the management of the electric light
plant was transterred to the Director of Public Service under authority of Ohio R.C
735.02. The authorily to fix electric light and power rates to be charged consumers of
the City owned electric light plant is vested in Council under the provisions of Ohio
R.C 715.03 and 715.06.

919.01 Connection charge for customers outside City limits.
919.015 Rules and regulations.

919.02 Rates.

919.03  Street lighting.

919.04  To be furnished City without charge.

919.05 Minimum and maximum cash surplus; rate adjustment.
919.06 Exterior Wiring

919.07  Current Shut-Off During Fire

919.08 Main Electrical Disconnect Required with Access

CROSS REFERENCES
Power to establish electric light and power rates - see Ohio R.C. 715.03. 715.06
Power to furnish light - see Ohio R.C. 715.06. 717.01
Power to erect electric works - see Ohio R.C. 743 34

SECTION 2: That former section 130537, entitled “Exterior Wiring”, of the Ambherst
Codified Ordinances is renumbered to 919.06 and is amended to provide as follows:

919.06 EXTERIOR WIRING.

All corporutiums. copaniierships, assewiations or itslividuals or ugents thercof.
operating in the Clix, must irstall and maintain all their esicrior and seivice wires in
any streel ar alley in the manier required by the repntations of 1he Public | 'ility
Loammiisss fuis of the Stake of Chic or any unders or regulutions siow or hersilber exisling,
mtadde by amy duly suthorized authority pussuant 1 s prevsdnions st the Public Lhility
Comnmissivim el e Stae ol Lidise

All poles and wires which are not in use and are not maintained in accordance
with the salcty and provisions of this chapter shall, upon wrstten notice by the City. be
repaired ui' femoved by the corporation. copartnership. #=ssiation or individual who
owns, operates, controls. manages or has charge of such wires and poles.



Al City signal or light wires removed for any cause shall be replaced by parties
removing the same to the satisfaction of the City and at no expense to the City

The Superintendent of Utilities shall have the power to require all exterior and
service wires to be placed and maintained as provided for in this chapter, and on written
notice from the Superintendent of Utilities to any corporation, partnership, association
or individual. or agent thereof, calling for the correction or removal of any wires or
poles or electrical apparatus of any kind, maintained contrary to the provisions of this
chapter, the same shall be immediately removed or corrected by such corporation.
copartnership, association or individual. or agent thereof, controlling, managing or
owning such wires, poles or apparatus. The City is also hereby authorized and
empowered (o cause the turning oft of the electric current from all conductors or
apparatus which are deemed by the City to be unsafe or which have not been instalied
in conformity with the provisions of this chapter.
(Ord. O-17-_ . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 3: That former section 1305.38, entitled "Current Shut Off During Fire". of the
Ambherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered to 919.07 and is amended to provide as follows:

919.07 CURRENT SHUT OFF DURING FIRE.

The Fire Chief, or some other competent person delegated by them, shall have
the power to, at once, cause the removal of all wires or the turning off of all electrical
currents or both where the circuit interferes with the work of the Fire Department
during the progress of a fire.

(Ord. O-17-_ . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 4:  That former section 1305.43. entitled " Main Electrical Disconnect Required
With Access ", of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered to 919.08 and is amended to
provide as follows:

919.08 MAIN ELECTRICAL DISCONNECT REQUIRED WITH ACCESS.

(a) From and after the effective date of this section, all electrical services
installed within the City shall have one main means of disconnecting the electrical
current delivered to such service. The Utilities Department of the City, or the utility
company furnishing eletricity to such service, if other than the Utilities Department of
the City, shall have aciu=s to such disconnect at all times.

(b) From and after the effective date of this section, any electrical service
requiritig or permitting "potential metering iraisformiiars"  or  "current metering
tranafinmers” shall have an individual, weather prusist discmmnect switch located on the
outside of the building to which such electrical service is connected. The Utilities
Department of the City, or the electrical company providing electricity to such service,
if other than the Utilities Department of the City, shall have access to such disconnect
switch at all times and shall have the right to disconnect electrical service to insure
safety or in the event of nonpayment by the using customer.

(c) All electrical services installed on buildings constructed after the
effective date of this section shall have electrical disconnects as provided in subsections
(a) and (b) herwof, installed at the time vl cunstruction, All existing buildings requiring
electrical disevnnects as provided in subsections (a) and (b) hereof shall have such
disconnects installed it the existing service is changed or updated

(1) All electrial services rated at 400 amps. 3 phase, and 400 amps.
single pluise. and lower shall have an outsile disconnect. This
shall also include residential dwellings used as a commercial
business. detached buildings from same. and agricultural
buildings.

(2)  Exempt shall be single family residential, 1-2-3 family
residential. and any service rated above 400 amps. unless
otherwise specified by the National Electric Code.  This
subsection (c) cannot be waived for any reason by any other
governing body except as stated in subsection (d) hereof.

idi Mhe Uiliies Department or Burlding Ceparomsent of the. Uiy may
waiye e aiseoniec] roquirement ai its s dbsendtion or omecase ol hanlship safen
reasuis, o 1 diue o I||.|I.I.I.::\-|'\-\.Il_1llil.!. ali |-|"||,L|“|.__. s, sl ae I|r||‘-:|,l,|.||:|,l.. lemices, ur dny
othur sbsiruction.  Tids can anily b secomplishied by wriltlen consemnt by balh pait s
(customer and Utility or Building Department) involved.

(Ord. O-17-__ | Passed xx-xx-xx.)



SECTION S: That it is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council
concerning and relating to the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of
this Council, and that all deliberations of this Council and ot any of its committees that resulted
in such formal action, were in meetings open to the public, in compliance with all legal
requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code

SECTION 6: That this Ordinance shall take eftect at the earliest period allowed by law

1" reading
2" reading John S. Dietrich, President of Council
3" reading

PASSED APPROVED

ATTEST
Mark Costilow, Mayor

Approved as to form by

Anthony R. Pecora, Director of Law

Filed with the Mayor:

A-17-31



A-17-32
ORDINANCE NO. O-17-_

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AMHERST CODIFIED ORDINANCE CHAPTERS
1331, 1336 AND 1337.

WHEREAS, the Buildings and Lands Committee of the Council of the City of Amherst. Ohio.
at a meeting held on June 5, 2017 met to consider the matter of the amendment of Part Thirteen
- Building Code. Title One - Standards. by amendments (o Chapters 1331, 1336 and 1337 of
the Coditied Ordinances of the City ot Amherst: and

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee voted to take the matter to the floor of
Council as amended; and

WHEREAS. the Council ot the City of Amherst deems it desirable for the public welfare and
safety of persons within the City to amend Part Thirteen - Building Code, Title One - Standards
of the Amherst Codified Ordinances in the manner set forth in the following sections.

NOW. THEREFORE. BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Amherst, County of
Lorain, State ot Ohio:

SECTION 1: That the index to Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1331 be amended to
provide as follows:

CHAPTER 1331
Building Department

1331.01 Department established.

1331.02 Appointment of Building Official.

1331.03 Qualifications of Building Official

1331.04 Duties of Building Official.

1331.05 Building Inspector and back-up Building Inspector.
1331.06 Electrical Inspector and back-up Electrical Inspector.
1331.07 Plumbing Inspector and back-up Plumbing Inspector
1331.08 Conflict of interest.

1331.09 Cash drawer.

1331.10 Monthly settlement.

CROSS REFERENCES
Enforcement: supervision; records - see Ohio R.C. 3781.03
Appeals from decisions of Building Inspector - see P. & Z. 1125.03
Permit and inspection fees - see BLDG. Ch. 1337

SECTION 2: That section 1331.02 is amended to provide as follows:

1331.02 APPOINTMENT OF BUILDING OFFICIAL.

(a) The appointment of the Building Official. as head of the Building
Department. and such other ofticers and/or support staft as are necessary for its propet
administration, shall be made by the Director of Public Safety and Service.

(b) The position of Building Ofticial is hereby declared to be a part-time
position to be paid a contract wage or salary for a specified number ot office hours. as
may be established from time to time by Council or shall be declared to be a full-time
position ta be paid an hourly rate as provided in the Memorandum of Understanding
between the City and the American Federation of State, County and Municipal
Employees, AFL-C1O it the full-time Building lnspector also meets the qualitication
requirements in section 1131.03 contained herein. The Building Official shall work
no more than forty (40) regularly scheduled hours per week.

(Ord. O-17-___ . Passed xX-xx-xX.)

SECTION 3: That Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1331.03 is amended to provide as
follows:



1331.03 QUALIFICATIONS OF CHIEF BUILDING OFFICIAL.

To be eligible for the position of Building Official, every applicant shall meet
the qualification requirements of the Ohio Board ol Building Standards for certitication
as a Buitding Official pursuant to section 4101:7-3 ol the Ohio Administrative Code
(Ord. O-17- Passed xx-xx-xA )

SECTION 4: That the former section 1331 04 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances. entitled
"Conflict of Interest”, is renumbered to 1331.08 and is amended as provided in Section |1
hereof.

SECTION S: That former section 1331.03 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered
to section 1331.04 and is amended to provide as follows:

1331.04 DUTIES OF BUILDING OFFICIAL.

It shall be the duty of the Building Official to be responsible for the overall
administration of the Building Department and enforcement ot adopted codes.
(Ord O-17- . Passed xx-XX-XX.)

SECTION 6:  That the former section 1331.06 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances, entitled "Monthly
Settlement”, is renumbered as 1331.10 and is amended as provided in Section 13 herein

SECTION 7:  That former section 1331.07 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered to
section 1331.05 and is amended to provide as follows:

1331.05 BUILDING INSPECTOR AND BACK-UP BUILDING INSPECTOR.,

(a) Ihere is hereby established the position of Building Inspector, who
shall be unclassified as to civil service law and shall be appointed by the Director of
Public Safety and Service.

(b) The position of Building Inspector is hereby declared to be a full-time
position to be paid an hourly rate as provided in the Memorandum of Understanding
between the City and the American Federation of State. County and Municipal
Employees. AFL-ClO. The Building Inspector shall work no more than forty (40)
regularly scheduled hours per week

(c) There is hereby established the position of back-up Building Inspector,
who shall be unclassitied as to civil service law and shall be approved by the Director
of Public Safety and Service. The back-up Building Inspector shall perform inspections
in the event of the unavailability of the Building Inspector pursuant to section 4101:7-2
of the Ohio Administrative Code.

(d) The compensation for the position of back-up Building Inspector shall
be fifty dollars ($50.00) for each inspection.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 8:  That former section 1331 08 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered to
1331.06 and is amended to provide as tollows:

1331.06 ELECTRICAL INSPECTOR AND BACK-UP ELECTRICAL
INSPECTOR.

(a) There is hereby established a part-time position of Electrical Inspector,
who shall be unclassitied as to civil service law and shall be approved by the Director
of Public Safety and Safety. The Electrical Inspector shall report to the Building
Official.

(b) The position of Electrical Inspector is hereby declared to be a part-time
position to be paid fifty dollars ($50.00) for each inspection or a negotiated wage or
salary, as may be established trom time to time by Council.

(<) There is hereby established the position of back-up Electrical Inspector,
who shall be unclassified as to civil service law and shall be approved by the Director
of Public Safety and Service. The back-up Electrical Inspector shall perform
inspections in the event of the unavailability ot the Electrical Inspector pursuant to
section 4101:7-2 of the Ohio Administrative Code.

(d) The compensation for the position of back-up Electrical Inspector shall
be fifty dollars ($50.00) for each inspection.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)



SECI'TON 10: That former section 1331 10 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is renumbered o
1331 07 and is amended to provide as follows:

1331.07 PLUMBING INSPECTOR AND BACK-UP PLUMBING INSPECTOR.

(a) There is hereby established a part-time position of Plumbing Inspector.
who shall be unclassitied as to civil service law and shall be approved by the Director
of Public Safety and Service The Plumbing Inspector shall report to the Building
Official

(b) The position of Plumbing Inspector is hereby declared to be a part-time
position to be paid fitty dollars ($50.00) for each inspection or a negotiated wage or
salary, as may be established from time to time by Council

(¢) There is hereby established the position of back-up Plumbing Inspector,
who shall be unclassitied as to civil service law and shall be approved by the Director
of Public Safety and Service. The back-up Plumbing Inspector shall perform
inspections in the event of the unavailability of the Plumbing Inspector pursuant to
section 4101:7-2 of the Ohio Administrative Code.

(d) The compensation for the position of back-up Plumbing lnspector shall
be fifty dollars ($50.00) for each inspection
(Ord. O-17- . Passed ax-xx-xx.)
SECTION I'1:  That section 1331.08, tormerly section 113.04 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances. is

amended to provide as follows:

1331.08 CONFLICT OF INTEREST.

No officer or employee connected with the Building Department shall be
financially interested in the furnishing of labor, materials or appliances for the
construction, alteration or maintenance of a building or in the making of plans or
specifications thereot within the City, unless he is the owner of such building. No such
officer or employee shall engage in any work which is inconsistent with his duties or
with interests ot the Building Department
(Ord O-17- Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 12: That section 131.09 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances is amended to provide as
follows:

1331.09 CASH DRAWER.

The Building Department, by and through the Building Official of the City. is
hereby authorized to draw the sum of one hundred dollars ($100.00) cash from the City
Auditor for the purpose of maintaining a cash drawer in the Building Department.

(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-XX-XX.)

SECTION 13: That section 1331.10, formerly section 1331.06 of the Amherst Codified Ordinances. is
amended to provide as follows:

1331.10 MONTHLY SETTLEMENT.

The Building Official shall make settlements at least monthly. or more
frequently as required by the City Auditor or Treasurer, for all fees collected by the
Building Department.

(Ord O-17-__ Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 14: That the index to Amberst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1336 be amended to
provide as follows:

CHAPTER 1336
Registration of Contractors

1336.01 Registration required.

1336.02 Exceptions.

1336.03 Work permit to be issued only to registrant.

1336.04 Application.

1336.05 License from the State of Ohio Department of Commerce required,
1336.06 Registration fee; issuance of certificate of registration.

1336.07 Certificate of insurance.

1336.08 Registration suspension or revocation.

1



1336.09 Hearing ot appeal.
1336.99 Penalty.

CROSS REFERENCLS
Power to license contractors — see Ohio R C 715.27

SECTION 15: That section 133601 of the Codilied Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.01 REGISTRATION REQUIRED.

Except as provided in section 1336.02 contained herein, no person. firm.
corporation or other entity shall engage in the construction, alteration. remodeling,
repair. removal or demolition of any building or structure or the alteration of land,
unless properly registered to perform such work pursuant to a certificate of registration
issued in conformity with the provisions of this chapter
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-Xx-xx.)

SECTION 16: That section 1336.02 of the Coditied Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amend to provide as follows:

1336.02 EXCEPTIONS.

(a) No provision of this chapter shall be interpreted to require registration
for officials or employees of public or Municipal utility organizations Lo engage in the
installation, alteration. repair, maintenance or utilization of any device, appliance,
installation or appurtenance forming part ot equipment for the generation, transmission
or distribution of any commodity or service which such public utility organization is
authorized by law 1o turnish or provide.

(b) No provision of this chapter shall be interpreted to require that the
owner of a one-, two- or three-family dwelling be registered or hold a certificate of
registration to personally perform work upon the premises  Additionally, no provision
of this chapter shall be interpreted to require that the owner of a non-residential
structure be registered (o hold a certificate of registration to personally perform work
upon the premises except those that require state licensing per 1336.05 contained
herein. However, this exception shall not apply to any person holding himself or
herself out to the public as a building contractor, builder or one engaged in any of the
building trades for profit. All such work shall be performed by such owner with the
assistance only of employees of the owner or gratuitous help. Such work shall be done
in conformity with this chapter and the rules and regulations promulgated hereunder
No work shall be done unless all permits, inspections and approvals required by Part
Thirteen of the Codified Ordinances of the City and other applicable City ordinances
are secured. For purposes of this division (b), a person shall be deemed to be an
employee of an owner only if the owner withholds from the compensation otherwise
payable to such person amounts for federal, state and local income taxes
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 16: That section 1336.04 of the Coditied Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.04 APPLICATION.

Application for registration pursuant to this chapter shall be made on forms
provided by the Building Official and shall set forth the name of the applicant. business
name and DBA name if applicable. business address, phone number. social security or
federal 1.D. number, and such other information as the Building Official may require.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-Xx-xx.)

SECTION 17: That section 1336.05 of the Coditied Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as tollows:

1336.05 LICENSE FROM THE STATE OF OHIO DEPARTMENT OF
COMMERCE REQUIRED.

Any and all persons, parties. tirms or corporations performing contracting work
in the following disciplines must have a valid license from the Ohio Department of

4



Commerce Ohio Construction Industry Licensing Board (OCILB) o1 Division of State
Fire Marshal as applicable:

(a) Electric
(b) Fire Protection
(¢) HVAC
(d) Hydronics and/or relrigeration
(e) Plumbing
(Ord. O-17- Passed xa-xx-xx.)

SECTION 18: That section 1336.06 of the Codified Ordinance of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.06 REGISTRATION FEE; ISSUANCE OF CERTIFICATE OF
REGISTRATION.

Upon receipt of the completed application. the required insurance and the
payment of the fee required by section 1337.05(a) of these codified ordinances. the
Building Official shall issue a certificate of registration to the applicant.  All
registrations shall expire on December 31st of the year of issue and may be renewed
annually thereafler upon the payment of an annual renewal fee in the sum set forth in
section 1337.05(a) of these coditied ordinances
(Ord. O-17- Passed xx-Xx-XX.)

SECTION 19: That section 1336.07 ot the Codified Ordinances ot the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.07 CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE.

Prior to the issuance of a certificate of registration, the Building Official shall
require an applicant to furnish a certificate of insurance, naming the City as an
additional insured, with policy limits of at least one-hundred thousand dollars
($100.000.00) per occurrence
(Ord. O-17-_ . Passed xX-XX-X\.)

SECTION 20: That section 1336.08 ol the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.08 REGISTRATION SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION.
The Building Official may suspend ftor up to one (1) year or revoke any
registration issued under the provisions of this chapter for any of the following reasons:

(a) Misrepresentation of a material face by the applicant in obtaining a
registration renewal thereof’

(b) Use of registration in obtaining permits for another person:

(c) Faulty or defective workmanship:

(d) Departure trom or disregard of plans and specifications filed with the
application for a permit; .

(e) The noncompliance with or violation of any provision of Part Thirteen

of the Codified Ordinances of the City

Any person, firm, corporation or association whose registration is suspended or
revoked shall not be issued another certificate of registration prior to the expiration of
the term of suspension or within two years from the date of revocation.
(Ord. O-17-_ . Passed XX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 21: That section 1336.09 of the Codified Ordinances ot the City of Ambherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.09 HEARING OF APPEAL.

A registrant whose registration has been suspended or revoked may appeal such
order of suspension or revocation to the Board of Zoning Appeals. Appeals shall be
made in writing and filed with the secretary of the Board of Zoning Appeals not later
than thirty (30) days after the receipt of the notice or order. The appellant may be
represented by counsel at his own expense. The Board of Zoning Appeals shall permil
the appellant and the Building Official to call witnesses and introduce competent



testimony pertinent to a hearing of appeal. The Board of Zoning Appeals may atfirm,
reverse or modify any decision taken by the Building Official.
(Ord. O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 22: That section 1336.99 of the Coditied Ordinances of the City of Ambherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.99 PENALTY.

Whoever violates any provision of this chapter shall be fined no more than
three-hundred dollars ($300.00) for a first offense. For a second or subsequent offense.
such person is guilty of a misdemeanor of the third degree and shall be fined not more
than five-hundred doltars ($500.00) or imprisoned not more than sixty (60) days, or
both.

(Ord. O-17-__ . Passed Xx-XX-XX.)

SECTION 23: That the index and cross references following the index to Chapter 1337 of the
Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst be amended to provide as follows:

CHAPTER 1337
Permit and Inspection Fees

1337.01 Generally.

1337.02 ‘aiting period for new construction; posting permit.
1337.03 Hevigation of permits. '

1337.04 General building fees; contractor registration.
1337.05 Defacing permits.

1337.06 Work started without permit.

1337.07 Permit procedure for moving existing structures.
1337.08 Impact fees.

1337.09 Expiration times.

1337.99 Penalty.

CROSS REFERENCES
Power to regulate - see Ohio R.C. 715.27
Required submission of plans of public buildings - see Ohio R.C. 3791.04
Fees for plan approval - see Ohio R.C. 3791.07
Sanitary sewer connection fees - see S. & P. S.913.07

SECTION 24: That section 1337.01 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1337.01 GENERALLY.

Except as otherwise specifically provided for, the following provisions shall
prevail in the issuance of all types of permits. The Building Official, before issuing any
permit, is authorized to charge and collect the fees and deposits specified in this
chapter. The fees prescribed herein shall be additive and, unless otherwise specifically
provided, separate fees shall be paid for each of the items listed.

(Ord. O-17-___ . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 25: That section 1337.02 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1337.02 CONSTRUCTION PLAN REVIEW; POSTING PERMIT.

Building permits for any construction project may be subject to a plan review
prior to the issuance of a building permit by the Building Official. All permits shall be
posted on the building or structure in a conspicuous area visible to the general public.
(Ord. O-17-___ . Passed xx-xx-XX.)

SECTION 26: That section 1337.03 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:



Commerce Ohio Construction Industry Licensing Board (OCILB) or Division of State
IFire Marshal as applicable:

(a) Clectric
(b) Fire Protection
(¢) HVAC
(d) Hydronics and/or refrigeration
(e) Plumbing
(Ord O-17- . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 18: That section 1336.06 of the Codified Ordinance of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.06 REGISTRATION FEE; ISSUANCE OF CERTIFICATE OF
REGISTRATION.

Upon receipt of the completed application, the required insurance and the
payment of the fee required by section 1337 05(a) of these codified ordinances, the
Building Official shall issue a certificate of registration to the applicant  All
registrations shall expire on December 31st of the year of issue and may be renewed
annually thereatter upon the payment of an annual renewal fee in the sum set forth in
section 1337.05(a) of these codified ordinances.

(Ord. O-17-_ . Passed xX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 19: That section 1336.07 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Ambherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.07 CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE.

Prior to the issuance of a certificate of registration, the Building Official shall
require an applicant to furnish a certificate of insurance. naming the City as an
additional insured, with policy limits of at least one-hundred thousand dollars
($100,000.00) per occurrence
(Ord. O-17-__ . Passed xx-xx-xx.)

SECTION 20: That section 1336.08 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.08 REGISTRATION SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION.
The Building Ofticial may suspend for up to one (1) year or revoke any
registration issued under the provisions of this chapter for any of the following reasons:

(a) Misrepresentation of a material face by the applicant in obtaining a
registration renewal thereof;

(b) Use of registration in obtaining permits for another person:;

(c) Faulty or detective workmanship:

(d) Departure from or disregard of plans and specifications filed with the
application for a permit:

(e) The noncompliance with or violation of any provision of Part Thirteen

of the Codified Ordinances of the City

Any person, tirm, corporation or association whose registration is suspended or
revoked shall not be issued another certiticate of registration prior to the expiration of
the term of suspension or within two years from the date of revocation,
(Ord. O-17-__ Passed xx-xx-xx)

SECTION 21: That section 1336.09 of the Coditied Ordinances of the City of Ambherst is
amended to provide as follows:

1336.09 HEARING OF APPEAL.

A registrant whose registration has been suspended or revoked may appeal such
order of suspension or revocation to the Board of Zoning Appeals. Appeals shall be
made in writing and filed with the secretary of the Board of Zoning Appeals not later
than thirty (30) days after the receipt of the notice or order. The appellant may be
represented by counsel at his own expense. The Board of Zoning Appeals shall permit
the appellant and the Building Official to call witnesses and introduce competent



CHAPTER 1337
Permit and Inspection Fees

1337.01 Generally.

1337.02 Waiting period for new construction; posting permit.
1337.03 Revocation of permits.

1337.04 General building fees; contractor registration.
1337.05 Defacing permits.

1337.06 Work started without permit.

1337.07 Permit procedure for moving existing structures.
1337.08 Impact fees.

1337.09 Expiration times.

1337.99 Penalty.

1337.02 CONSTRUCTION PLAN REVIEW; POSTING PERMIT.

Building permits for any construction project may be subject to a plan review
prior to the issuance of a building permit by the Building Official. All permits shall be
posted on the building or structure in a conspicuous area visible to the general public.
(Ord. O-17-__ . Passed XX-XX-XX.)

SECTION 26: That section 1337.03 of the Codifted Ordinances of the City of Ambherst is
amended to provide as follows:






Electric Service Upgrade
Generator









ASSED

ATTEST



